
Robert G. Alexander
Death has claimed one of:

the best known and beloved;
natives of Fulton county.-
iRobert Gibson Alexander,
;66, a life long resident of
jFulton county, died at his
homo in McConnellsburg on
'December 28, 1955, after a
lingering illness of two and
one-half years.

He was born of the late
James Grere and Hannah!
Washabaugh Alexander and
was born in Ayr township on .
August 11. 1889. He was
united in marriage to Laura
Henry on April 7, 1914. To,
this union was born one son|
James Franklin.

Mr. Alexander had taught
school within the county for i
four years, after which he
became an employee of the-
Fulton County Bank for 39 j
years. In this occupation he
became widely known and:
respected throughout the
county. His advice and assist
ance to many, who sought
his better judgment, proved
valuable in many business
dealings.

He has been a life long
member of the Reformed
church. He was also a mem
ber of George Washmgcon
Lodge No. 143 F. and A. IB,
Geroge Washington Royal
Arch Chapter No. 176. Jaffa
Shrine and I. O. O. F. _

Survivors include his wid-,
ow, his son, one brother
Scott, and one grandson, all
of McConnellsburg.

Friends were received at
the Kelso funeral home and
services were held at 2:0<
p m. onSaturday, Decembei
31, conducted by his pastor,


